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INTRODUCTION 
As volunteer administrators be­

come more and more important in 
the process of helping within self­
sufficient communities, the cre­
dentials and professional background 
of these individuals come under scru­
tiny. Naturally, management is skep­
tical of persons who have little to 
document in terms of credentials, 
while some leaders of volunteers 
have concern about forcing a highly 
structured credentialization program 
on the field which might only serve 
to drive talented, innovative indi­
viduals from the profession. Vern 
Lake, Chief of Volunteer Services in 
the Minnesota Department of Public 
Welfare points out, volunteer ad­
ministrators: 

••• feel they deserve to be recog­
nized as a profession among the 
professions. Yet, it is not always 
clear as to what kind of recogni­
tion is sought... Progress has been 
made, but we are still far from 
being recognized as a profession 
among the professions. The possi­
bility has not even occured to 
some. To others, it lacks ur­
gency, even interest. 

The need to affiliate and network 
with others in the field is felt by 
many, however. These individuals, 
despite their diversified backgrounds, 
attempt to meet organizational and 
community needs while plotting a 
course of personal growth. 

This desire to meet needs and 
maintain personal development takes 
different forms for different indi­
viduals. Many leaders of volunteers 
do find that a local professional 
group helps them in terms of con­
tacts and current information in their 
field. Others find that identification 
with a national professional group is 
important to themselves and their 
employers. On the other hand, or­
ganizations at the state level seem 
suspect; what can the value be for 
such affiliations? While the values of 
such affiliations for each individual 
will vary, a recent survey done in 
Pennsylvania indicates that volunteer 
administrators in this State feel the 
need for a state professional organi­
zation to enhance their efforts at 
networking, guarantee communica­
tion and information exchange, and 
ensure an avenue for professional de­
velopment. Such an organization 
could go far toward relieving the 
concern Mr. Lake identifies among 
volunteer co-ordinators "that their 
work is not reco~ized for its breadth 
and complexity." 

The authors chose to undertake 
such a survey in an effort to create 
some identity for those in Pennsyl­
vania who direct the efforts of volun­
teers. Without concrete knowledge 
of who "we are, and what we do," 
volunteer administrators will never 
achieve the recognition some feel 
they deserve. As a group, however, 
volunteer administrators are woefully 

Sandra Hohenwarter Heisey is the Director of Community Services for the 
Lancaster County Chapter, American Red Cross in Lancaster, Pennsylvania. 
In addition to developing programs staffed by volunteers, she is a Red Cross 
national instructor concerning staff/volunteer relationships and effective 
group leadership. She is a charter member of the Lancaster County Council 
of Volunteer Co-ordinators, a local network for volunteer administrators. 
Alice Heitmueller is Director of Outreach Ministries, First United Methodist 
Church, Lancaster. For eight years she directed the Shared Holiday Program 
for the Lancaster County Council of Churches. She is a board member of the 
Lancaster County Association for Children & Adults with Leaming Dis­
abilities. 
THE IOURNAL OF VOLUNTEER ADMINISTRATION 13 
Summer 1984 



uninformed about the issues which 
affect their fledgling profession. 
Robin Burns, coordinator of volunteer 
services for the South Carolina De­
partment of Social Services, claims: 

We need better ways to work to­
gether to upgrade and receive re­
cognition for our field. We need 
to be aware of legislation that 
affects us, such as tax breaks for 
volunteers, special tax categories 
for older Americans, courses in 
the schools to promote better vol­
unteer citizen involvement, 
recognition, and encouragement 
of the use of volunteers in go3 
emment, and many other issues. 
In determining to undertake a sur-

vey of certain leaders of volunteers 
in Pennsylvania, the authors wished 
to identify any desire or need for 
statewide networking for volunteer 
administrators. An additional benefit 
of such a survey for the profession as 
well as for individuals within the vol­
unteer community is the determina­
tion of who volunteer coordinators 
are and what they do. As Janet 
Richards, church volunteer admini­
stration consultant, stated in the Fall 
of 1982 while preparing to chair the 
Pennsylvania State Symposium for 
Volunteerism and Education for 1983: 
"We cannot afford to sit back and 
allow government to reinvent or de­
fine the volunteer sector." Thus, it is 
necessary for volunteer administra­
tors to look to themselves, to define 
who they are and to be counted. The 
survey undertaken by the authors is 
only a beginning of what should be­
come a self-renewing process. 

ST ATE OFFICE ON VOLUN-
TEER ISM? 

The issue of State Offices on Vol­
unteerism first came to the surf ace 
in 1973 when the National Governors' 
Conference published a statement 
advocating State Offices. The func­
tions of such of fices took the form of 
two possibilities: support £or volun­
teer programs operating in state 
agencies and institutions, or support 
for volunteer programs within private 

agencies. The purposes of a State 
Office on Volunteerism, as proposed 
in 1973, were: 

1. to co-ordinate and assist estab­
lished volunteer programs; 
2. to initiate new volunteer pro­
grams; 
3. to develop supportive legisla­
tion; 
4. to train state personnel in vol­
unteer administration; 
5. to recruit and place volunteers; 
6. to provide a liaison among 
community groups; 
7. to provide a meeting for dis­
cussion of questions of public in­
terest; 
8. to provide volunteer recogni­
tion; 
9. to assist with cultivation of 
funding sources. 
In 1973, in response to the Na­

tional Governor's Conference, AC­
TION made funding available to 
states that were interested in estab­
lishing a State Office. Thirty-two 
states made appucation for such 
funds at that time. 

In Pennsylvania, the concept of a 
State Office was viewed as both posi­
tive and negative. Government 
seemed in favor of the idea, while 
resistance among the state's in­
dependent volunteer administrators 
seemed strong. The reasons given for 
supporting a State Office included 
the encouragement of greater use of 
volunteers in state programs and ser­
vices, the publication of information 
about Pennsylvania volunteer efforts, 
and creation of a means to increase 
citizen participation in public affairs. 
Those who opposed such an Off ice 
felt that government had no business 
in the administration of volunteers, 
and that the independent and non­
partisan qualities of the voluntary 
sector would be tainted by govern­
mental intervention. There was an 
additional issue raised by the Gover­
nor's desire to place the new State 
Office on Volunteers in the Depart­
ment of Welfare. 

Naturally, those in opposition to 
the State Office were quick to pro-
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pose an alternative which seemed 
less threatening to many in the field. 
The idea of the formation of a state­
wide professional organization grew 
out of opposition to a State Office. 
Initial disappointment by those wish­
ing to form a State Off ice stymied 
efforts by others to develop the pro­
fessional organization concept. How­
ever, at the Pennsylvania Statewide 
Symposium on Volunteerism and Edu­
cation held at Pennsylvania State 
University in 1981, momentum 
seemed strong enough to begin. 

PA VINE: WORKING ALTERNATIVE 
Spearheaded by Voluntary Action 

Center directors and volunteer ad­
ministrators interested in pro­
fessional growth for the field, PA 
VINE (Pennsylvania Volunteer Infor­
mation Network Exchange) was es­
tablished. Initially without funds for 
mailing and printing, the PA VINE 
published a newsletter intermittently 
from Fall, 1981 through early Sum­
mer, 1983, with money from scat­
tered individual donations and in-kind 
services. At the 1983 PA Statewide 
Symposium on Volunteerism and Edu­
cation, a resolution was introduced 
by the Lancaster County Council of 
Volunteer Coordinators recom­
mending that the PA VINE formalize 
itself into a true professional organi­
zation at the state level. The organi­
zation would not attempt to compete 
with any established group, but 
rather would fill the gaps which pre­
sently exist in the professional net­
work. system. This resolution was 
based on the outcome of a statewide 
survey conducted between January 
and April, 1983 for the Lancaster 
group. The results of that survey 
follow. 

INTRODUCTION TO SUR VEY 
In conducting a survey of Pennsyl­

vania volunteer administrators, the 
authors found many individuals wil­
ling to help. In addition, the Lan­
caster County Council of Volunteer 
Coordinators provided funds for 
printing. Penn State University in-

THE JOURNAL OF VOLUNTEER ADMINISTRATION 15 
Summer 1984 

eluded the survey in its mailing of 
information about the PA Symposium 
on Volunteerism. Individual members 
of the Lancaster Council offered 
their services in tallying, collating, 
typing, and preparing the raw data. 

While the 1983 Volunteer Mana­
gers Survey is non-scientific, it is the 
first effort to survey and identify 
who, in fact, administers volunteers 
in Pennsylvania. And despite its 
many shortcomings it does draw a 
composite picture of the "typical" 
volunteer administrator in the state. 
In many ways, this individual fills the 
stereotype often associated with vol­
unteering. The typical survey re­
spondent is a white female with col­
legiate background; however, there 
are some surprising trends visible 
from the data. In addition, the sur­
vey pointed out overwhelmingly the 
desire on the part of Pennsylvania 
managers to form and join some 
structured statewide organization for 
their mutual self-benefit. The 
uniqueness of the survey lies in its 
effort to draw upon the body of pro­
fessional information available only 
from managers of volunteers, rather 
than volunteers themselves. 

The survey authors found no mail­
ing list of volunteer managers avail­
able. The only real list available was 
the marketing list compiled by Penn 
State University to promote the 1983 
PA Symposium on Volunteerism and 
Education. That list, by no means 
comprehensive, became the vehicle 
through which 8,500 surveys were 
dispersed. Those whose names were 
on the list included previous Sym­
posia participants, participants in 
continuing education workshops in 
volunteerism and related fields, and 
others who had "expressed an inter­
est" in being informed. 

Based on examination of the com­
plete mailing list of 8,500 names, 
Susan Ellis, president of Energize, a 
consulting firm on volunteerism, es­
timates that 35% or 2,975 of the 
recipients were not involved in the 
volunteer movement at all. This 
would include head nurses, nursing 



home administrators, Pennsylvania 
state government department heads 
and the like. Therefore, responses 
were not expected from this group, 
leaving a more realistic survey popu­
lation of 5,525. Of these, 390 were 
returned, a 7% return from those 
actually in the field. Sixteen surveys 
were discounted because the re­
spondents were neither residing nor 
working in Pennsylvania, and nine 
others were received from consul­
tants or VAC directors who were not 
able to respond appropriately to the 
questions asked. Thus, the total tal­
ley of responses utilized was 366. 
While this rate is low, and might at 
first seem to represent insufficient 
data, it is well to remember that 
nearly 400 people of a very diverse 
group did respond. If a better list 
than the Penn State Symposium mail­
ing list existed, the authors should 
and would have used it. The low 
response percent helps to underscore 
the fact that the diversity of the 
group referred to as "volunteer ad­
ministrators" is so great that even 
listing them for a single state is a 
giant task. 

So little research exists with re­
gard to volunteer adminstrators, in 
contrast to the ever-growing work on 
voll'.lnteers, that even this small sur­
vey sample bears reporting. Elmer 
Miller and Terri Rittenburg, report­
ing on continuing education for vol­
unteer leaders in Nebraska, found 
themselves faced with the same dif­
ficulty. They feel the 8.4% response 
rate to their survey resulted from the 
survey going to too many persons 
"not familiar with the concept of the 
Volunteer Leader Development 
Series, coupled with the fact that 
follow-up techniques were not 
used. 115 Since neither titles nor or­
ganization names were included on 
the mailing list, appropriate follow­
up was virtually impossible. 

The survey results, for ease of 
examination, were grouped into five 
categories: Personal Profile, Agency 
Profile, Community Profile, Career 
Profile, and Professional Insights. 

PERSONAL PROFILE 
The "typical" respondent in the 

state of Pennsylvania is between 35 
and 55 years of age. Volunteer ad­
ministrators are, by an overwhelming 
majority of 3 to 1, fem ale. The 
educational level of these fem ales is 
high; 185 of 361 responding to this 
question indicate that they possess at 
least a Bachelor's degree. For many, 
the field of volunteer administration 
is a second career, one for which 
they did not specifically train. Fully 
two-thirds had a first career; a ma­
jority of them were teachers, others 
were social workers and still others 
administrators. 

AGENCY PROFILE 
This typical volunteer administra­

tor supervises an average of 125 vol­
unteers, although the number is 
pulled up by national organizations 
such as the American Red Cross, 
with local chapters which represent 
large numbers of volunteers serving 
in a single organization. The vast 
majority of these . managers super­
vised 100 or fewer volunteers. It is 
interesting to note that these find­
ings correlate with those published by 
Miller and Rittenburg who found 
from their survey of Nebraska volun­
teer leaders that the number of vol­
unteers in an organization ranged 
from two to 2,000, "with 100 being 
the most co~mon response and 70 
the median." 

The agency within which the vol­
unteer administrator functions is pri­
marily concerned with social ser­
vices. Fully 236 of the respondents 
are associated with institutions. 
Health services represent 207 other 
agencies, while educational services 
are provided by 192. {It is important 
to remember that many agencies are 
multi-faceted, providing more than 
one service in their communities.) 

Of those responding, 283 agencies 
are not-for-profit, 23 for profit, and 
59 government. The primary source 
of funding for many of the agencies 
is government, including federal, 
state, and local grants. Third party 
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payments are second as a source of 
funding, while private donations as a 
primary source of funding are third. 

Two-hundred-ten respondents in­
dicated that their organization was 
not a part of a larger national group. 
The other 150 respondents indicated 
that they were affiliated in some way 
with a national organization. The 
national memberships are divided in­
to two types: a parent organization 
that charters local efforts, such as 
American Red Cross, American 
Heart Association, or the American 
Cancer Society; or common interest 
groups such as the National Associa­
tion of Foreign Student Affairs, the 
National League of Nursing, or the 
National Nursing Home Association. 
This seems to uphold the belief that 
most voluntary efforts are local and 
not nationally or governmentally 
mandated. 

COMMUNITY PROFILE 
The communities in which these 

agencies provide service vary. A 
majority of those responding serve a 
community of 25,000 or less, often a 
part or all of a county. Close upon 
that group, however, were eighty re­
sponses from population areas of 
50,000 to 100,000 persons. The large 
metropolitan areas were also well 
represented, with sixty responders 
serving a population in excess of 
500,000 persons. By and large, the 
population served was a mixed popu­
lation, not a community representing 
specific urban, suburban, or rural 
populations. 

A majority of those in the field 
work with the aged or with mixed 
populations, as these two groups were 
equally represented well ahead of any 
other specific target population. The 
general public, probably through edu­
cational programs, was second, while 
children and youth service groups 
were third. 

Of sixty-seven counties in Penn­
sylvania, fifty-six were represented 
by the respondents. Philadelphia 
County was most heavily represented 
with fifty-three responses, while 
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Lancaster County, the sponsor of the 
survey, provided twenty-four re­
sponses. Delaware and Montgomery 
Counties (bordering Philadelphia) also 
placed as top areas in which volun­
teer managers function. 

CAREER PROFILE 
In attempting to map a career 

profile from those responding, the 
authors encountered difficulty collat­
ing answers from the question con­
cerning job titles. Many of those 
providing major support for volun­
teers are not known as "Volunteer 
Administrators." Many, in fact a 
majority of 184, have the title of 
Director; 95 are Volunteer Coordina­
tors. Other titles by which volunteer 
managers are known are almost as 
varied as the organizations which 
employ them. Some examples are: 
Department Head, Chairperson, Su­
pervisor, President, Administrative 
Assistant. 

A majority of those who lead vol­
unteers divide their time equally 
among the management tasks of re­
cruitment and retention, recognition, 
interviewing and placement, staff/ 
volunteer relationships, problem­
sol ving, training, and supervision. 
Some fifty-one individuals spend a 
majority of their time in supervision, 
while recruitment and problem­
solving demand a large percentage of 
the time of thirty-two persons each. 

Of those willing to share salary 
ranges, 177 earn between $10,000 and 
$20,000 for full-time employment. 
Eighty-nine persons earn over 
$20,000. Of those responding, 297 
are full-time employees of their or­
ganizations, while sixty are part-time 
personnel. Included in this group of 
responders were twenty-four who in­
dicated that they receive no salary 
for their services. 

Despite the fact that "typical" 
volunteer administrators did not start 
out with formal career training in 
volunteer administration, by and 
large, they are a highly "work­
shopped" group (possibly affected by 
the variable of the mailing list com-



TABLE la TRAINING 

Question 19. Please check the areas of training you have 
taken in volunteer managementa 

29 . . . . . 160 . . . 300 

Staff/Volunteer Relationships I 259 

Recruitment~ Retention I 241 

Training~ Supervision I 21a 

Interviewing~ Placement I 211 

Effective Listening I 194 

Evaluation~ Recordkeeping 1184 

Time Management I 173 

Public Relations~ Marketing I 167 

Volunteer Recoenition I 163 

Group Dynamics I 153 

Connittee ~ Board Workl 118 

Grantsmanship I 77 

Other l54 

I 41 (Volunteer Coordinator Certification) 
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ing from Penn State). Three-quarters 
of the individuals responding have 
had training in staff/volunteer rela­
tions, and in recruitment and reten­
tion. Almost as many have back­
ground in interviewing and place­
ment, as well as in effective listen­
ing. The training which volunteer 
managers most consistent! y lack is in 
grantsmanship (See Table 1). 

Most probably grantsmanship and 
volunteer coordinator certification 
fare poorly for two reasons. First, it 
is only recently that volunteer man­
agers have begun to see the value of 
such training, and second, each has 
higher costs than the more ubiquitous 
workshops. Furthermore, few re­
spondents are Association for Volun­
teer Administration (A VA) certified. 
This national association has recently 
established a performance-based cer­
tification which will supercede 
earlier certifications. The value of 
AVA certification, old or new, is only 
beginning to be felt by thf individual 
volunteer administrator. Three­
quarters of those responding in­
dicated that their organizations do 
have some funding available for on­
going training and skills development 
for the volunteer manager. This is 
significant in light of the special 
skills needed by practicing pro­
fessionals and the unique application 
of other more generic management 
techniques. 

PROFESSIONAL INSIGHTS 
When the volunteer administra­

tors of Pennsylvania look at the 
world in which they direct the ener­
gies of volunteers, they see three 
critical interlocking problems: a per­
ceived shortage of volunteers, 
coupled with an increased demand for 
services, and hampered by a distinct 
lack of funding. They face these 
problems and k~ep themselves 
abreast of new directions in the field 
in part by belonging to local pro­
fessional groups. Fully 50% of those 
responding are members of such a 
group. One hundred forty-two belong 
to statewide groups such as the Hos-
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pital Association of Pennsylvania, 
and the Pennsylvania Association for 
Non-Profit Homes for the Aging. 
One hundred thirty-four belong to 
other groups at the state and national 
levels. 

When questioned about their feel­
ings concerning PA VINE in its pre­
sent form (an occasional newsletter 
bolstered by the annual Symposium) 
volunteer administrators in Pennsyl­
vania strongly support a system of 
networking, communication and in­
formation exchange. This is coupled 
with a slightly less intense desire for 
professional development. Small 
numbers feel that political action and 
advocacy are important functions of 
a statewide volunteer administrators 
group. 

SURVEY GENERATES ACTION 
PLAN 

After preparing, distributing, and 
collating the survey, the authors 
carefully examined the results of the 
last item reported, the nature and 
role of the PA VINE. (See Table 2). 
From the results of and from discus­
sions with· volunteer managers in 
Southeastern and Southcentral Penn­
sylvania, it seemed that action was in 
order. The authors presented pre­
liminary results of the survey to the 
Lancaster County Council of Volun­
teer Coordinators, and found af­
firmation among that group's mem­
bers. As a result, the authors gener­
ated a resolution to expand and 
strengthen PA VINE, making it, 
finally, the statewide professional or­
ganization which seems to be desired 
in Pennsylvania. The resolution, 
which follows, was presented at the 
annual PA State Symposium on Vol­
unteerism in June, 1983. This annual 
event, held by Penn State University 
each year since 1979, attracts more 
than 100 persons in the field of Penn­
sylvania volunteerism from a diverse 
group of organizations. The Sym­
posia, three days in length, offer 
workshops, plenary sessions, and 
small group discussions fostering vol­
unteerism and professional growth. 



TABLE 2: Identified Functions 

23. What would you consider the most important function 
of the PA VINE? ~o LOO 180 

• • t 4 t I I t t 

a. professional 74 development 

b. 
networking/ 144 communication 

information 141 c •. 
exchange 

d. political 
36 action-

e. advocacy 32 

f. other (10) 

no answer 20· 

TOTAL A,NSWERS: 366 
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At the 1983 Symposium, 113 persons 
from all parts of PA were in at­
tendance. After reading and de­
bating, a resolution was voted upon 
and passed by a vast majority of 
those present. The resolution states: 

Whereas, the leaders of volunteers of 
the state of Pennsylvania have 
been surveyed, 

And whereas, they have indicated 
their support for the PA Volun­
teer Information Net work Ex­
change for the purpose of net­
working, communication, and in­
formation exchange on pro­
fessional matters, 

And whereas, the nature of such 
communication and networking 
needs to be regular and de­
pendable, 

Now be it Resolved, that the PA 
VINE define its purpose and goals 
through formal by-laws which re­
flect the desires of the PA volun-­
teer movement. 

Be it also Resolved, that geo­
graphical regions be determined 
to facilitate networking of groups 
and individuals within the state, 

And be it further Resolved, that the 
PA VINE identify funding sources 
to carry out its work, including an 
annual membership fee to indi­
viduals and groups. 

Debate was expected to be active 
and rigorous; instead, the resolution 
passed with all in favor and a single 
abstention. A concern raised during 
the debate was that the formation of 
a state professional organization 
would "hinder development of a State 
. Office on Volunteerism." Remarks 
were negative, however, toward gov­
ernment's taking the lead in or­
ganizing volunteerism for Pennsyl­
vania. All conference participants 
were in firm agreement that the pro­
fessional leaders of volunteers in 
Pennsylvania need to be identified, 
become known statewide, and gather 
political clout through a state associ­
ation of volunteer managers. 
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As a result of the passage of the 
resolution, the assembled conferees 
formed a Steering Committee to 
achieve two goals: the formulation 
of by-laws, and the gathering of a 
geographical mailing list. It is ex­
pected that the by-laws will be for­
mulated by June, 1984, and that they 
will be debated at the 1984 PA Sym­
posium. (Ed. note: This has oc­
curred.) The mailing list should de­
fine regions within the state for net­
working which could take the form of 
regional meetings or conferences. It 
is further anticipated that the 1984 
PA State Symposium on Volunteerism 
and Education will have a special 
opportunity--the opportunity to vote 
for the creation of a statewide pro­
fessional group to serve the needs of 
volunteer administrators as they seek 
tools to improve the quality of life 
for others and their own professional 
status. 

PROJECTIONS AND INSIGHTS 
The 1983 PA Symposium had as 

its closing session speaker, Steve Mc­
curley, Director of Program Ser­
vices, VOLUNTEER: The National 
Center for Citizen Involvement. His 
address, titled "Marketing Volun­
teering to Management--The New 
Climate," discussed what volunteer 
managers need to do within their own 
agencies to sell the idea of volun­
teering and to demonst§ate its po­
tential and importance. Mr. Mc­
Curley stated that volunteer ad­
ministrators need marketing skills as 
much as large corporation heads to­
day, because of the psychological cri­
sis generated by being beginners in a 
relatively undefined profession. Mc­
Curley urged marketing for success • 
"Our agencies don't understand what 
we do. If we are successful, where 
do we go--up and out of the field! 
We have no personal r~ognition with 
no 'stars' in our field." This address, 
urging volunteer managers to market 
themselves, was significant in light 
of the Personal Profile developed by 
the survey. The typical manager of 
volunteers lacks the expertise to 
market his/her credentials and quali-



TABLE 3: Sources of Income 

Questibn 10. 
What is your main source of income? 

Numbe 
Ans. 

a. 

(51) 

b. 

(26) 

c. 

(21) 

d. 

(18) 

e. 

(69) 

f. 

(64) 
g. 

(42) 

H. 

(12) 

i. 

(23) 

j. 

(5) 

k. 

(78) 

1. 

(31) 

(14) 
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fications, as well as those of volun­
teers, to prospective employers and 
volunteer utilizers. Furthermore, 
this individual often fails to take the 
initiative in advocating for his/her 
volunteer program in particular, and 
voluntary action in general. 

For example, in 1977 Wyatt B. 
Durrette, Jr. wrote about the ignor­
ance of the average legislator with 
regard to volunteer potential. The 
legislator, claimed Durrette, 

••• still thinks of volunteers as the 
Rotary Chm, the Lion's Club, the 
Jaycees, the Junior League or the 
Women's Club. He may have no 
idea that extensive volunteer pro­
grams in corrections, mygtal 
health, welfare, even exist •••• 

Most volunteer managers will agree 
that many legislators today are no 
more educated than the group re­
f erred to in 1977. If that is so, 
however, the volunteer manager is to 
blame, Too little fanfare is gen­
erated by the profession about its 
own successes. 

On the other hand, professionals 
in volunteerism have been quick to 
point out to legislators that while 
volunteers are "free," their activities 
need to be managed by professionals 
(just as does the utilization of any 
other resource) and "that it is ap­
propriate and cost effective for a 
government organization to allocate 
funds for 1~e management of these 
resources." 

These examples show the great 
need for unity and singleminded pur­
pose in our budding profession. With­
out vehicles such as state associa­
tions and local self-help groups, in­
dividual efforts are often lost. Rapid 
turn-over and early burn-out cause 
some respondents to be concerned 
only with learning the job, not ad­
vocating for improved professional 
status. 

The membership of the Lancaster 
County Council of Volunteer Coor­
dinators, for example, seems to re­
flect feelings expressed by some at­
tending the Symposium that certifi­
cation is an unsure investment, not 
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necessarily leading to better jobs or 
larger salaries. These concerns pin­
point aspects of McCurley's psycho­
logical crisis. One revealing com­
ment from a survey respondent sum­
marizes the problem: 

I began the directorship position 
in December, so I'm still deep in 
the throes of getting myself or­
ganized. One thing I've noticed is 
that when it comes right down to 
promotion, PR or any "hom­
blowing," it just hasn't been done 
in years. Consequently, we've 
blended in with everything com­
paratively mediocre. I received a 
degree in Communications/PR 
and my goal is to at le~ try to 
revive a mellowed spirit. 

WHAT'S IN THE FUTURE: TOUGH 
TIMES, FINANCIAL WOES 

Of great concern to professionals 
in the field are budgets and finances. 
According to Steve Mccurley there 
will be further budget cuts for non­
profit agencies of 2896 between 1983 
and 1985, causing a $37 billion cut­
back from the $ I 15 billion level of 
1982. These cutbacks will lead to 
much increased interest on a national 
level in volunteerism, because, states 
Mccurley, 5096 of the U.S. population 
believes volunteers can do every­
thing, since it means survi~al of 
agencies, jobs, and services. His 
projections are ominous when con­
sidering the answers to the survey 
question, "What is the main source of 
income for your agency?" (See Table 
3.) Of the 440 responses, forty are 
agencies with two main funding 
sources, twelve with three main sour­
ces, and eight have multi-funding. 
Fourteen gave no answer. There are 
sixty agencies receiving funding from 
two or more sources, representing 
only 696 of the total respondents. 
Obviously, multiple funding sources 
will become a necessity in the near 
future. 

Also consider that the single lar­
gest combined category of funding 
reported in number 10 is government: 
federal, state, and local. These 17 5 



TABLE 4: Critical Problems 

,µ Question 16. What would you say the most critical pro S fll 
0 Cl! blem area in volunteer-staffed programs and services .,._ 
-... is for your area and organization? 0 
cu ,µ 
00 CRITICAL PROBLEM AREA~ C: ,µ 10 50 90 tll UI NUMBER OF RESPONSES: IX .,.. • a . • . • • l I 

1. SHORTAGE OF VOLUNTEERS 94 

-- . 

2. 
INCREASED DEMAND FOR I 88 SERVICES: 

3. LACK OF FUNDING: 51 

4. 
STAFF/VOLUNTEER 

47 RELATIONSH,IPS: 

-

5. 
COMMUNITY COOPERATION 

44 
~ AWARENESS: 

6. 
VOLUNTEER PROGRAM 18 NETWORKING: 

7. 
STAFF CUTBACKS/ 16 LAYOFFS: 

a. ADVOCACY NEEDS: 8 

TOTAL ANSWERS: 366 
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respondents stand to loose significant 
additional funding. This bleak pic­
ture exists at a time when volunteers 
are asking for and needing more and 
more in the way of enabling funds to 
continue to function. To make mat­
ters worse, answers to question num­
ber 9 point out that 243 of the 266 
respondents are non-profit and total­
ly dependent upon funding sources for 
survival, as only 23 respondents rep­
resent for-profit organizations. 
Seventy-eight of those responding, 
both non-profit and otherwise, do re­
ceive third party payments. 

A ROCK AND A HARD PLACE 
The corollary concern when fund­

ing is in jeopardy is the utilization of 
existing or diminishing resources. 
The New Federalism which is enter­
ing its fourth year as national policy 
has cut deeply into social programs 
once thought sacrosanct. Volunteer 
administrators would do well to rea­
lize that the competition will be not 
only for dollars, but also for com­
mitted volunteers. James C. 
Thompson, Jr., writes that pro­
fessional volunteer administrators 
will feel the second wave of New 
Federalism as they see increasing 
volunteer awareness of advocacy, 
self-help, and political action but 
most probably a topping-off in the 
ranks of volunteers in hospitals, 
schoo~s, '¥hd traditional social service 
agencies. 

Survey question number 16 asked: 
"What would you say is the most 
critical problem area in volunteer­
staffed programs and services for 
your geographical area and organiza­
tion?" Before looking into the de­
tailed answers, it is interesting to 
note that Mccurley agrees with 
Johnson that within the next three to 
five years there will be an "incredi­
ble" increase in the need for volun­
teers. Consequently, competition 
will become a critical issue for man­
agers of volunteers. Problem areas 
identified by volunteer administra­
tors in answering survey question /116 
can be seen in Table 4. 
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George Gallup, Jr., one of the 
nation's leading pollsters,. notes a 
number of trends which will have 
dramatic impact on the volunteer 
movement. He especially enumer­
ates the impact of the growing num­
ber of women who work outside the 
home. Forty-four of every 100 
women are currently employed. The 
"me ethic," characteristic of the 
l 970's is having an impact yg the 
quality of citizen involvement. 

Survey respondents identified 
three problem areas as becoming 
critical within the next two years: 
shortage of volunteers, increased de­
mand for volunteers to provide ser­
vices, and lack of funding. It would 
seem that Pennsylvania follows na­
tional trends! Another critical prob­
lem to surface in Pennsylvania is the 
trend to cut the volunteer manager's 
position first when faced with budget 
cuts. The volunteer manager's re­
sponsibilities are then delegated to 
other staff members who may or may 
not have the skills or interest neces­
sary to work with volunteers. Cer­
tainly, many of those so affected 
claim that they do not have the time 
to do an effective job. One coordina­
tor writes: 

My position here is coordinator of 
a large program, part of which 
includes volunteer coordination. 
Because of funding losses we no 
longer have a designated volun­
teer coordinator, so I have '~b­
sorbed" those responsibiltties. 1 

Another respondent from a nursing 
facility writes: "An active volunteer 
program can be a full-time position 
for a c.oordinator. Volunteers will be 
the salvation of ma~~ nursing facili­
ties in the future." Another in­
dividual bemoans the difficulty of 
marketing her job to management: 

Volunteer coordin,1tion is only one 
aspect of my position as "Re­
source Co-ordinator" and is new 
to our agency; the ref ore, it has 
been catch as catch can. Con­
vincing management in social ser­
vices that in the long run it is an 
appropriate use of my time when 



social services are in such q~­
perate straits is very difficult. 

And a final comment from a volun­
teer administrator who responded 
from out of state points out that the 
problem is more widespread. She 
writes: "Lack of funding--no paid 
clerical assistance--! am tied to sta­
tistics, clerical work and really can­
not adequately do the jo~911m quite 
capable of in other areas." 

Two additional aspects of the 
coming crisis are the need for suf­
ficient staff support and the need for 
volunteers with specialized skills. 
Warm, friendly bodies will fail, in 
many cases, to fill the bill. Even 
when staff support and management 
backing is available, programs relying 
upon volunteer leadership suffer if 
there are no persons willing to be 
more than a cog in the larger wheel. 
It seems that some programs at least 
are suffering from the rather unique 
situation of too many braves and not 
enough chiefs. Says one volunteer 
manager, "We have no trouble obtain­
ing volunteers, but program chairmen 
are hard to find. Qualified people 
are either working or over-extended 
regardi~ community commit-
ments." A mental health pro-
fessional comments: 

Most critical for me is the prob­
lem of finding persons able to 
work comfortably with Mental 
Health/Mental Retardation resi­
dents. In some instances the Vol­
unteer must have some pro­
fessional expertise to work with 
clients, especially if t~ 1 client/ 
resident is "challenging." 

SUMMARY 
The 1983 PA Volunteer Managers 

Survey reported upon here served a 
three-fold purpose. First, it became 
the vehicle which launched · a move­
ment toward a statewide professional 
organization for leaders of volunteers 
in Pennsylvania. Second, it is an 
attempt to define an answer to Janet 
Richards' challenge concerning "who 
we are, what it is we do, and who we 
serve"--in other words, to arrive at a 

definition of our profession. It would 
have been most interesting to ask 
which persons had only the single job 
responsibility of managing volun­
teers, or what types of volunteer jobs 
are most in demand. It might also 
have been interesting to identify by 
name the local volunteer groups with 
which the respondents are affiliated 
for local professional development 
and networking. The survey cannot 
be termed scientific because of the 
only distribution vehicle available-­
the Penn State University Symposium 
mailing list. On the other hand, it is 
a beginning of a satisfactory defini­
tion of those individuals in the state 
of Pennsylvania who consider them­
selves to be in the business of man­
aging volunteers. Without such defi­
nition, the profession has no chance 
to develop clout, a collective iden­
tity, or a forum for informed de­
cision-making about the future. 

Finally, the survey results give 
statistical credence to the fact that 
the major problems facing Pennsyl­
vania volunteerism today are nation­
wide, as the results of the limited 
number of responses from persons in 
Ohio, Delaware, Maryland, Virginia, 
and New York indicate. 

From a modest beginning as an 
alternative suggestion to a State Of­
fice on Volunteerism, the idea of a 
state association has grown to the 
point that in June, 1984 the Pennsyl­
vania Statewide Symposium con­
ferees will have the opportunity to 
vote such an association into exis­
tence. That reality reflects a growth 
of professional awareness that paral­
lels the heightened interest across 
the nation in volunteerism. Pennsyl­
vania's experience reflects Kerry 
Kenn Allen's observation in "Volun­
teering in America: A Status Report 
1981-1982" that: 

We have leamed that volunteering 
encompasses a broad range of di­
verse activities and is the um­
brella for citizens with divergent 
political views but who share a 
belief that things can be lf ade a 
little better for everyone. 
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Pennsylvania's volunteer admini­
strators see the need to move beyond 
a concern merely for volunteer 
bodies to a professional concern 
about the "potential consequences for 
volunteerism of the federal thrust to 
reduce support for human services ••• 
that reflects ~ change in national 
social policy." It would seem that 
volunteer administrators in Pennsyl­
vania have a tremendous amount of 
networking and advocacy before 
them, if they are to truly define and 
shape their own profession, assuring 
its maintenance by its own skilled 
practitioners. 
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Ed. Note: On June 7, 1984 the par­
ticipants at the 1984 PA Symposium 
on Volunteerism and Education did 
indeed vote to form the Pennsylvania 
Association for Volunteerism (PAV). 
A slate of officers was elected fol­
lowing approval of a set of By-laws. 
By the end of the Symposium, dues 
had been collected from the first 
"Charter Members" and plans made 
for a series of regional conferences 
around the State. Congratulations to 
all concerned! 

PA VOLUNTEER MANAGERS SUR VEY 1983: 

RESULTS 

1. What is your age? 

a. 18-25 (15) (b) 26-35 (112) c. 36-45 (86) d. 46-55 (86) 
e. 56-65 (54) f. 66-75 (8) g. over 75 (0) 

2. What is your sex? a. Male (70) b. Female (295) 

3. What is your title? 185 are Directors; 95 are Volunteer Coordinators; 25 
are Department Heads 

4. What is the highest formal education you have completed? 
a. High School (15) b. Associate Degree (40) c. Bachelors Degree 
(178) d. Masters Degree (84) e. Doctorate (8) 

5. Is being a Volunteer Coordinator a first career for you? a. Yes (207) 
b. No (148) ' 
A. If Yes, what was your first career? 

1. teachers ( 42) 2. social workers (16) 3. administrators (11) 
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DETAILED RESULTS TO QUESTION 5, PA VOLUNTEER MANAGERS 
SURVEY 1983 

5. (A.) What was your first career? 
teacher (42) 
social worker (16) 
administrator (11) 
secretary (9) 
manager (9) 
registered nurse (9) 
homemaker (8) 
activities director/coordinator (6) 
public relations (6) 
therapeutic recreation (6) 
director of social services (5) 
counselor (5) 
librarian (4) 
minister (4) 
medical technologist (3) 
therapist (3) 
executive director (3) 
chemist (2) 
university/ college professor (2) 
military (2) 
program director (2) 
medical assistant (2) 
interior designer (2) 
administrative assistant (2) 
gerontologist 
market researcher 
politics 
worked for YMCA 
hostess 
historian 
worked with retarded children 
advertising 
employment agent 
meterologist 
home economist 
developmental psychologist 
human resource specialist 
dental assistant 
insurance business 
probation officer 
bookkeeper 
research biologist 
communications 
pardons case specialist 
Boy Scout executive 
off ice worker 
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physical therapist 
National Hospice organization 
accountant 
artist 
tax consultant 
family therapist 
community administration 
pre-med student 
commercial display 
service rep. phone co. 
paralegal worker 
rehab education 
elementary school principal 
editor, internal communications 
student affairs 

This is my THIRD CAREER: 

teacher/newspaper editor 
teacher/hospital counselor 
teacher/counselor 
teacher/ director social services 
research analyst/ teacher 
muse um registrar/ teacher 
secretary/ manager 
executive secretary/ 

estate mgr. assist. 
social worker/librarian 
book reviewer/group theatre 

sales 
minister/probation officer 
bookkeeper/office manager 
director Red Cross/director stu-

dent union 
juvenile counselor/law enforce­

ment 



6. What is the TOTAL number of volunteers serving your agency, organiza­
tion or institution? 
a. 50-100 017) b. 100-250 (81) c. 250-500 (75) d. 500-1,000 (40) 
e. 1,000 or more (34) 

7. How many volunteers are serving in your individual PROGRAM? 
a. 25-50 (94) b. 50-100 (81) c. 100-200 (62) d. 200-500 (67) e. 500-
1,000 (19) f. 1,000 or more (12) 

8. What services does your agency, organization or institution provide? 

31 a. public safety 
207 b. heal th 
107 c. emergencies 
236 d. social services 

149 h. recreation 
179 i. counseling 
85 j. religion 
152 k. rehabilitation 

74 e. cultural 
25 f. government & politics 
192 g. education 

33 1. economic development 
106 m. advocacy 
82 n. other 

9. In what sector is your agency, organization or institution? 
a. non-profit (283) b. for profit (23) c. government (59) 

10. What is the main source of income for your agency, organization or 
institution? 

51 a. private donations 
26 b. community solicitations 

2T c. Church/religious groups 
18 d. membership dues 
69 e. federal government 
64 f. state government 

42 g. local government 
72 h. foundations/ grants 
23 i. profits 

5j. investments 
78 k. 3rd party payments 
3T I. other 

* 11. Is your agency, organization or institution a part, chapter or di vision of a 
national organization? a. Yes (150) b. No (210) 

A. If YES, please state the name of the National Organization here: 
1. American Hospital Association (12) 2. ACTION (12) 3. RSVP & 

American Red Cross (7 each) 

12. What is the population of the community your volunteers serve? 
a. 25,000 or less (92) b. 50,000-100,000 (80) c. 100,000-200,000 (45) 
d. 200,000-300,000 (34) e. 300,000-500,000 (24) f. 500,000 or more (60) 

13. Is the population you serve primarily: 
a. urban (73) b. suburban (76) c. rural (51) d. mixed (164) 
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14. What sector of the population do your volunteers mainly serve? 

87 a. aged 
48 b. children & youth 
68 c. general public 

2T d. physically handicapped 
41 e. mentally handicapped 

35 f. accident/illness/victims 
2T g. low-income persons 
9h. unemployed/under-employed 
87 i. mixed population 

15. How do you spend the largest percentage of your time as a volunteer 
coordinator? 

33 a. recruitment 32 f. problem-solving 
16 b. retention 20 g. training 

4 c. recognition 5T h. supervision 
28 d. interviewing/placement 206 i. equal time on all 
25 e. staff/volunteer relationships -

16. What would you say the most critical problem area in volunteer-staffed 
programs and services is for your geographical area and organization? 

51 a. lack of funding 
94 b. shortage of volunteers 
16 c. staff cutbacks/layoffs 
8 d. advocacy needs 

17. What is your annual salary? 

24 a. no salary - volunteer 
6b. under $1,000 
21 c. 1,000 - 5,000 

18. Are you employed: 

88 e. increased demand for services 
47 f. staff/volunteer relationships 
44 g. community cooperation/awareness 
18 h. volunteer program networking 

43 d. 5,000 - 10,000 
177 e. l 0,000 - 20,000 
89 f. over $20,000 

a. part-time (60) b. full-time (297) c. self-employed (2) d. unemployed 
(4) e. currently laid off (0) f. employed, but looking for another job (2) 

19. Please check the areas of training you have taken in volunteer manage­
ment: 

241 a. recruitment & retention 118 h. committee & board work 
211 b. interviewing/placement 184 !· evaluation &_ record keeping 
163 c. recognition 153 J• group ~yna~mcs. 
218 d. training & supervision 194 k. effE:ct1ve h_stenrng . 
259 e. staff/volunteer relationships 167 1. public relat1ons/mark~t~ng 
77 f. grantsmanship ..!t.!. m. volunteer coord. certified 
173 g. time management 54 n. other 
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20. Does your agency, organization or institution provide educational funding 
for you? 
a. Yes (243) b. No (l 08) 

*21. In what county do you work? 56 of the 67 counties in PA were represented 

1. Philadelphia(53) 2. Lancaster(24) 3. Delaware(21) 4. Montgomery(20) 

22. To what professional organizations do you belong? 

185 a. local volunteer coordinator group 
90 b. inter-agency professional group 

ill c. state-wide professional group 
7 5 d. National Association for Volunteer Administr 
134 e. other national professional organizations 

23. What would you consider the most important functi< 

74 a. professional development 
144 b. networking/communication 
141 c. information exchange 
36 d. political action 
32 e. advocacy 
7o f. other 
(20 No Answer) 

* Detailed results not given in total, only top three respon. 
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